
AGENDA REQUEST FORM 

COMMISSIONER'S COURT 


SOMERVELl COUNTY, TEXAS 


FOR AGENDA OF: September 26,2011 

DEPARTMENT: Auditor 

DATE SUBMITTED: 9-12-11 

REQUEST: Take Action on sealed bids for Crushed Stone 



SOMERVELL COUNTY 

BID TAB 
CRUSHED STONE 
Oct. 1, 2011 thru Sept. 30, 2012 

VENDOR AMOUNT 
Mills $4.00 
Vulcan Construction $6.25/ton 
Squaw Creek Materials, L.P. $6.00/ton 

f.o.b. Weatherford 

Award to Mills 09-26-11 



AGENDA REQUEST FORM 

COMMISSIONER'S COURT 


SOMERVELL COUNTY, TEXAS 


FOR AGENDA OF: September 19,2011 

DEPARTMENT: Auditor 

DATE SUBMITIED: 9-15-11 

REQUEST: Rescind & Re-award #35 Rubigan under Herbicides on the 

Chem/Fert bid. 



HERBICIDES 


ITEM DESCRIPTION PICG Agrlum DWl Ewing GRAuto Helena JD Lan<! Lonestar Winfield 

I Barricade 65 WDG 6/3 lIb= $28.24 $20.04 No Bid No Bid $22.50 $31.00 $39.34 $23.50 

2 Barricade 65 woe Substitute llb= $14.50 $12.31 $14.99 No Bid $14.25 $27.50 $19.50 $15.25 

3 Sarricade Flowable (Syngenta) 50 gal 1 gal­ $117.00 $117.00 NeBld NeBld $117.00 $117.00 $129.32 $117.00 

4 Sarric.de link Pack (Syngenta) lib­ $135.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $117.00 $135.00 No Bid $135.00 

5 Bensumoc 2.5 gal 1 gal­ $89.44 $87.80 $99.00 No Bid $88.00 $116.60 $107.40 $83.$5 

6 Celsius (Bayer) 10 az btl 1 bottle­ $75.00 $88.00 NoBld No Bid $85.00 $85.00 No Bid $75.00 

7 Certainty lOxl.2502 loz"" $66.00 $55.81 No Bid No Bid $84.50 $72.88 $91.61 $56.00 

8 Confront 4/1 1 gala $127.00 $109.37 No Bid No Bid $123.00 $14225 $146.39 $114.70 

9 Dimension 2 EW 2.5 Gal 1 gal­ $226.00 $185.75 No Bid No Bid $213.00 $257.00 $251.86 $182.00 

10 Dimension lJ1tra 8x 50z IOl= No Bid $2.42 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $3.19 $4.01 $93.20 i 

11 Di.miss South 1 pint 1 pint­ $153.57 $124.61 No Bid No Bid $139.75 $178.02 $170.62 $136.96 

12 DriveXLR8 .5 gal .5 llal= $85.00 $55.65 No Bid No Bid $183.00 $110.00 $6289 $64.48 
, 

13 Finale 2/25 1 gal­ $69.00 $39.72 $89.90 No Bid $68.25 $90.14 $87.63 $65.00 

14 Horsepower 2/2.5 1 gal= NeBid $4298 No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid $65.98 $43.22 

15 IUoxan 4/1 1 gal­ $194.00 $189.84 NeBld No Bid $191.00 $253.50 $225.12 $175.00 

16 5edgehammer 10/1.30z 10z= No Bid $51.15 $65.38 NoBi<! $88.00 $97.00 $62.89 $55.00 

17 Manor loz"" $30.50 NeBld $39.50 No Bid $35.00 NoBld $40.32 $15.56 

18 Monument (Syngenta) 25 grams 1 gram­ $9.60 $9.60 No Bid NaBi<! $9.50 $9.60 $11.47 $9.60 

19 MSMA #6 wIsurfactant 2/2.5 1 gal­ $20.00 $17.96 No Bid No Bid $26.00 No Bid $19.03 No Bid 

20 Omamec 4/1 1 gal- NeBld $125.65 No Bid No Bid $150.00 $178.83 $152.58 $75.00 

21 Outrider (cnty roads) 200z 102:= No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid $16.26 $13.00 

22 Primo Max 2/1 1 gal­ $275.00 $275.00 No Bid NoBld $275.00 $275.00 $314.43 $275.00 

23 Primo Max Substitute 2/1 1 gal­ $205.00 $170.00 $248.00 No Bid $220.00 $192.20 No Bid No Bid 

24 Princep 4 Ib Al.I GA 2/2.5 1 gala $19.98 $15.84 No Bid No Did $20.50 $25.44 $21.64 $17.76 

25 Remedy Igal 19a1m No Bid $57.90 No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid $68.58 $88.00 

26 Revolver 1 qt 1 qt­ $180.00 $173.40 NeBld NoBld $525.00 $525.00 $221.52 $174.50 
27 Reward 2.5 1 gal­ $89.00 $82.94 NeBld No Bid $89.00 $89.00 $98.84 $89.00 
28 Ronstar Flowable 2/2.5 1 gal­ $170.00 $158.95 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $239.02 $198.70 $159.20 
29 Ronstar G 50lb bag 1 poun<i= $1.30 $1.23 No Bid No Bid $1.30 $1.38 $1.96 $1$6.00 
SO Ox.diazon Flowable 2.5 gal 1 gal­ $133.00 No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.00 
31 Roun<lup Pro 2/2.5 1 gal- No Bid $18.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.311 No Bid $20.80 
32 Roundup Pro Substitute (41 % Glyphosate) 2/2.5 1 gal­ $15.00 $11.52 $16.35 NeBld $13.00 $14.16 $10.05 $10.00 
33 Roundup Pro Max 1.67 gal 1.67 gala No Bid $48.86 $85.00 NeBld $37.00 $72.33 $74.78 $55.62 
34 ~oundup quick Pr(}+ 6.811>- .. ­ bottle- NoDld $55.13 $85.00 No Bid $68.00 No Bid $78.35 $62.00 



35 Rubigan 1 gal 1 galu $276.84 ~ 

36 Sencor 51b Ilb= No Bid $61.57 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $86.91 $15.75 $56.51 

37 ~le ~. ~ ~ $i!S,OO N&8kI N&8kI ~ N&8kI N&8kI N&8kI 

38 TrimecPlus 2.5 gal 1 gal= ~18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38,00 $6(),90 $45.25 No Bid 

39 Trimec Southern 2/2.5 1 gal= $.18.00 $39.79 $44.70 No Bid $39.75 $74.80 $49.58 $36,10 

9/19/11 #35 Rescind from Winfield and re-award to BWI 


• 




• 


WINFIELD' 

SOLUTIONS 

Date: _9/15/2011 

Subject: Rubigan Price Adjust 

To: Somervell County 

From: Raymond Prefume 

Dear Somervell County, 

Due to increases in price over this past year, Winfield solutions cannot honor our bid 
quote for Rubigan AS. We apologize for any inconvenience this will cause and we thank 
you for the opportunity to bid. If you require further clarification please contact me at the 
contact information below. 

Thank you, 

Raymond Prefume 
711 Venture Rd 
Waco, Tx 76710 
254-640-0549 
~prefume@landolakes.com 

Winfield Solutions, LlC I A Land O'lakes Company ­

mailto:prefume@landolakes.com


• 

Somervell Purchasing 

From: Jeff Hansen [squawmaint@valornet.com] 

Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2011 12:27 PM 

To: 'Somervell Purchasing' 

Subject: FW: Rubigan pricing 


BWI Rubigan quote 

Jeff Hansen 

Golf Course Superintendent 

Squaw Valley Golf Course 

1203 CR 332 

Glen Rose, Texas 76043 

254897 7932 office 


~Qyaw_nlaint@valorng~.i=om 
www.sauawvalleyg<;:..com 

From: Kolby Keeling [mailto:KolbyKeeling(iilbwicomRanies.(omJ 
Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2011 10:46 AM 
To: 'Jeff Hansen' 
SUbject: Rubigan pricing 

Rubigan $276.84 I gallon 

I~()IIJ', Kedlll\( 
Regional Coordinator

bun 
1418 - Upfield Dr 
Carrollton, TX 75007 
214-546-6858 Cen 
kolbykeeling@bwicompanies.com 

This message has been scanned for viruses and 
dangerous content by MailScanner, and is 
believed to be clean. 

1 

mailto:kolbykeeling@bwicompanies.com
mailto:KolbyKeeling(iilbwicomRanies.(omJ
www.sauawvalleyg
mailto:Qyaw_nlaint@valorng~.i=om
mailto:squawmaint@valornet.com


AGENDA REQUEST FORM 

COMMISSIONER'S COURT 


SOMERVELL COUNTY. TEXAS 


For Agenda of (Date): ~0//! 
Department: 

Date Submltmd: 

Request: 

b/Tif tZY1 ~.pi,ht C~ ---t:.r RnuM!:;t 

• 




Group Membership Agreement Extension 

Plan Year 10117/11 -10/16/12 


This agreement is by and between CareFlite, a 501(c)3 non-profit Texas Corporation and the County of 
Somervell, Texas (hereinafter County) is agreed to as of and effective on the 17th day of October 2011. 

Whereas; CareFlite is authorized by the State ofTexas to offer Air Ambulance Memberships in Somervell 
County. Texas. and 

Whereas; County desires to extend the current contract that provides a CareFlite Air Ambulance 
Membership for each ofits personnel as defined below for the coming year; 

Therefore; the parties agree asfollows: 

County agrees to extend the current contract which expires October 16, 2011. The extension will provide 
a CareFlite Air Ambulance Membership for each of its employees and officials at a cost of $10 per 
employee or official for the plan year shown above. County agrees to pay the total sum of $1 0 times the 
number of employees and officials on or before November 16,2011 in order to comply with the Slate 
regulations governing membership programs. All other terms and conditions of the original contract 
between CareFlite and County will remain in effect throughout this extension. As of the date of this 
extension agreement, the County has a total of personnel to be covered 

New applications are not required for renewing personnel who already participate in this program. 

For planning purposes, the parties acknowledge that the rate for this group will be increased by $1 per 
employee per year when County renews on 10117/12. 

By their signature below, the individuals signing represent that they have the authority to enter this 
agreement and that their respective organizations intend to be bound by the terms herein. A fax copy shall 
have the same force and effect as an original document. 

CAREFLITE SOMERVELL COUNTY, TEXAS 

q~... LO ~~ 
9/13/11 

James C. Swartz Date Honorable Mike Ford Date 
President & CEO County Judge 
jswartz@careflite.org mikeJord@glenrose.com 

Also emailedtobarbara_hudson@valomet.com (County Treasurer) 

mailto:emailedtobarbara_hudson@valomet.com
mailto:Jord@glenrose.com
mailto:jswartz@careflite.org


AGENDA REQUEST FORM 

COMMISSIONER '5 COURT 


5OMERYELLCOUNTY,TEXAS 


For Agenda of (Date): 

Department: Cowa..,ISS/~ S" 

Date Submitted: 
I ( 

Request: 

'f)LTIl: t7Y1 ~-CGq,-lQO ,£ JC,b-Ju,fUM ,..,.10 

• 




REQUEST FOR LINE ITEM TRANSFERS 


DATE: '1-{;f:1 
TO: 

This is a request to transfer funds from one line item to another within the 
department listed below. 

DEPARTMENT: 


AMOUNT OF MONEY TO BE MOVED: ;;z....,f5f;f[) 

FROM (title and # of line item) She\j~ 
2fh't£. TCn~M:) 


TO (title and # of line item) S D.~ f;:ff. 

tf€r"Le fir 1t;fo~ f e 

GIVE EXPLANATION for transfer funds 

YU-t( 


:be 5fo 

..,.s....ig-n-a'""tu-re-o-.t...D"""e"""'l.4'l..el..n...t"THT"e..::;a....<tI-':.:::....-1"?£0partm

Note: This request must be submitted to the commissioners office for review 
by all commissioners prior to being placed on the agenda for action. 

This request was received in the Judge's office on 

http:D"""e"""'l.4'l..el


REQUEST FOR LINE ITEM TRANSr~RS 


DATE: "ll~ I 
TO: 

This is a request to transfer funds from one line item to another within the 
department listed below. 

DEPARTMENT: ;Sbepff DfG'<-<2: 
AMOUNT OF MONEY TO BE MOVED: I 6QO 

FROM (title and # of line item) 

TO {title and # of line item) 

GIVE EXPLANATlON for transfer funds 

Signature of Departmttkead 5(D. 

Note: This request must be submitted to the commissioners office for review 
by aU commissioners prior to being placed on the agenda fur action. 

This request was received in the Judge's office on 



REQUEST FOR LINE ITEM TRANSFERS 


DATE: StqI(\
TO: 

This is a request to transfer funds from one line ilem to another within the 
departmentlisted below. 

DEPARTMENT: 


AMOUNf OF MONEY TO BE MOVED: 

FROM (title and # of line irem) 

TO (title and # of line item) 

GIVE EXPLANATION for transfer funds 

Note: This request must be submitted to the commissioners office fur review 
by aU commissioners prior to being placed on the agenda fur action. 

This request was received in the Judge's office on 



VOIL~/LVLV ~Vft LV:~ij ¥AX ~~4 ~~I ~9jl Somervell County I<lIOOllOOl 

Request For Line Item Transfers 

Date: ct· IS-II 


To: Somervell County Commissioners 


This is a request to transfer funds from one line item to another 

within the department listed below. 


Department: _--,-D_PS____________ 

IoI f\C'/': 

Amount of Money To Be Moved: $__-"--_<>1_____ 

From (title and #ofline item): l:\;')'l·'-1olP lAecitea..l "'15D.00 

Lj~'l·Lj3o "'\OO~ l\Jl·'-\S'l4<bD.OO 4~'1-t.fOO~ IlPS;Li< 4.:rJ-JI',;-c, "','-/'1c'£ 

To (title and # of line item): --=4'-..:9,=-,-'1-,-,-,3",-,-,1\,---"of,--,-f-,-","tt",--,.s"""""-1e~p,,--,\,,-,t:,=~,,--_-,-,\SD""cg 

l{ ~1-2>\ ~ COf(\f\.,:!er Su. ef1', (5 3b~~ 

'\:~1-~'1D eqll'lfl IlDO_oo___________ 

Give Explanation For Transfer Funds: {o VMc.k-e \l\\(, -- o-(.L U SUfp It C$ 

floC{/. ')W.'v-\b be w.eJ l" f!\OtoIz-q,T &~'''1 

•Signature ofDepaknent Head 

Note: TIris request must be submitted to the commissioners office for 
review by all commissioners prior to being placed on the agenda for 

action. 

TIris request was received in the Judge's office on ________. 

http:l\Jl�'-\S'l4<bD.OO


Request For Line Item Transfers 

Date: q~~'ll 
To: Somervell County Commissioners 

This is a request to transfer funds from one line item to another 
within the department listed below. 

Department: CAllSt@le 
Amount ofMoney To Be Moved: $ j.f(){f9 

From (title and # of line item): Pr', (,Ljc'9 j 14. 435 

, 


To (title and # ofline item): U".fol<,{f1S Lfll/· t}55 ~OiJ.it) 

'tIY-311 OffiCi ,3,!.ifli e.S. OlOO.t>O 

Give Explanation For Transfer Funds: _--to pr,uc},a,se 1M jfciLfijJ $fu·~t.s 

AtJC aftct S<&wlil$ 

Signature ofD~t Head 

Note: TIris request must be submitted to the commissioners office for 
review by all commissioners prior to being placed on the agenda for 
action. 

This request was received in the Judge's office on ______---' 



09/15/2011 THU 15:05 FAX 254 897 1113 Somervell County Bxpo IOlI001/001 

REQUEST FOR LINE ITEM TRANSFERS 

DATE: 9-15:- 2L> fl. 

TO: SOMERVELL COUlVI'Y COMMISSIONERS 

This is a request to transfer funds from one line item to another within the 
department listed below. 

DEPARTMENT: EXpo/Ampbi 

AMOUNT OF MONEY TO BE MOVED: ~!oo 
FROM (title and # of line item) . 

ExpQ/Ampbi 

TO (title and # of line item) 

. Expol Ampbi 

GIVE EXPLANATION for transfer funds 
..-~ • 

must he submitted to the Judge's office to he placed 
on the court agenda for action. 


This request was received in the Judge's office on 




AGENDA REQUEST FORM 

COMMISSIONER'S COURT 


SOMERVELL COUNlY. TEXAS 


For Agenda of (Date): 

Department: 
I 

Date Submitted: ;/£J/IJ
I 

Request: 

Jht=tA~Mj Lhye...JXM htut±4 l£..rS Ct1:fr 


